
GLOUCESTER TOWNSHIP COUNCIL MEETING
OCTOBER 22, 1012
MUNICIPAL BUILDING, CHEWS LANDING NEW JERSEY

Pledge Allegiance to the Flag

Invocation: Deacon Peter Shoemaker gave the invocation.

Statement: Mr. Bianchini  read a statement setting forth the time, date and place of this meeting, 
that it was properly advertised, posted and filed in the Office of the Township Clerk pursuant to 
the Open Public Meetings Act. 

Roll Call:        Mr. Hutchison Mr. Carlamere, Solicitor
Mr. Schmidt
Mr. Siler Mr. Cardis, Business Admin. 
Mrs. Gentek - abs. Mrs. DiJosie, Twp. Clerk, RMC
Mrs. Trotto Mayor Mayer
Mr. Mercado
Mr. Bianchini Mr. Moffa, Public Works

Mr. Lechner, Comm. Dev. 
Chief Earle, Police

PUBLIC PORTION:
Mr. Bianchini opened the public portion.
Mr. Polidoro questioned the amount received for the liquor license.  Mr. Bianchini stated that the 
liquor license was a private sale, and not one of the licenses that the township owned.
There being no further comment, the public portion was closed.

MINUTES:  Mr. Siler made a motion to waive the reading and accept the minutes of:
Regular Minutes: 10/10/12

seconded by Mrs. Trotto.  Roll call vote: All in favor. Motion carried.  6-0.

ORDINANCES:

O-12-25
ORDINANCE OF VACATING A PORTION OF MELBOURNE 
LANE, LOT 27 AND LOT 17 WHICH IS TO BE CONSOLIDATED
TO BECOME NEW LOT 17, IN THE TOWNSHIP OF GLOUCESTER, 
COUNTY OF CAMDEN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY

WHEREAS,  a certain portion of Melbourne Lane, Lot 27 and Lot 17 which is to be 
consolidated to become new Lot 17, located within the Township of Gloucester and more 
particularly herein described, are lands heretofore dedicated as a public street; and

WHEREAS, Township Council of the Township of Gloucester has determined that the 
public interest would be best served by vacating said portion of Melbourne Lane and releasing 
and extinguishing all public rights therein except all rights and privileges possessed by public 
utilities as herein after reserved:
       NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Township Council of the Township of 
Gloucester, County of Camden, and State of New Jersey as follows:

SECTION 1.  That the certain part of Melbourne Lane herein described be and is hereby 
vacated and all public rights therein arising from the dedication of said lands as a public street 
except all rights and privileges possessed by public utilities hereinafter reserved, be and the same 
are hereby released and extinguished:

ALL THAT CERTAIN TRACT of land situate in the township of Gloucester, County of 
Camden and State of New Jersey being more particularly described as follows:

   More Particularly Described
              in accordance with Schedule “A” attached hereto:

EXCEPTING  THEREOUT AND  THEREFROM  any  necessary  easement  for  access, 
drainage and/or  utilities  and excepting  from vacation and expressly  reserving,  all  rights  and 
privileges possessed by public utilities, as defined in R.S. 48:2-13 and by any cable television 
company,  as  defined  in  the  “Cable  Television  Act”,  N.J.:S.A.48:5A-1  et  seq.,  to  repair  and 



replace their existing facilities in, adjacent to, over or under the street or portion thereof herein 
described.

SECTION 2. After introduction and first reading, a copy of this ordinance, together with 
notice of Second Reading and public hearing hereon shall be published and also posted on the 
Bulletin Board in the Gloucester Township Municipal Building by the Township Clerk not less 
than ten (10) days prior to the time fixed for further consideration for final passage and public  
hearing. At least one week prior to said time fixed for further consideration for final passage, a  
copy of this ordinance together with notice of Introduction thereof and the time and place when 
the Ordinance will be further considered for final passage and public hearing shall be mailed by 
the Township Clerk to every person whose lands may be affected by the Ordinance, so far as the 
same may be ascertained, directed to his last known post office address.

SECTION 3. All ordinances and provisions thereof inconsistent with the provisions of 
this Ordinance shall be and are hereby repealed to the extent of such inconsistency.

SECTION 4. If any section, subsection or part, clause or phrase of this Ordinance shall 
be declared invalid by judgment of any court of competent jurisdiction, such section, subsection, 
part, clause or phrase shall be deemed to be severable from the remainder of the ordinance.

SECTION 5. This  Ordinance  shall  take  effect  immediately  after  final  passage  and 
publication as required by law.

Introduced: October 22, 2012
Adopted: _________________________

PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL
ATTEST:

_________________________
TOWNSHIP CLERK

_________________________
MAYOR

Mr. Carlamere explained the ordinance and stated that this is part of the Conifer acquisition.  He 
stated that Melbourne is a paper street.
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried. 6-0.

RESOLUTIONS:
TABLED RESOLUTION
R-12:10-224

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE SALE OF SURPLUS
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT 

WHEREAS,  the Township of Gloucester is the owner of the vehicles and equipment 
which are no longer needed for public use and,

WHEREAS,  the  Township of Gloucester  desires to  authorize  the sale  of the  surplus 
vehicles and equipment at public sale pursuant to NJSA 40A:12-2 to the highest bidder, a copy of 
the list of surplus vehicles and equipment is on file in the office of the Township Clerk

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Council of the Township 
of Gloucester, County of Camden, and State of New Jersey, as follows:  

l.  The  Township  Council  of  the  Township  of  Gloucester  hereby  declares  the  
described surplus equipment is no longer needed for public use. 

2.  The Township Council of the Township of Gloucester authorizes and directs to  
take any and all steps necessary to proceed with a public sale of said surplus  
equipment. 

3.  The notice of the date, time and place of the public sale and the conditions of sale, 
shall be published in the Courier Post Newspaper, the official newspaper of the 
Township of Gloucester, stating that the sale will be held on November 10, 2012
Saturday, at 10:00 am at the Public Works Building on Erial Road.

4.  No limit shall be placed on the number of surplus vehicles that can be purchased 
by any one bidder. 

This Resolution shall take effect immediately. 



Tabled:  October 10, 2012
Adopted: October 22, 2012

________________________
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL 

ATTEST

______________________________
TOWNSHIP CLERK
Mr. Mercado made a motion to remove from table, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  
All in favor.  Motion carried. 6-0.
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor.  
Motion carried. 6-0.

CONSENT AGENDA

R-12:10-231
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING CHANGE ORDER NO.  1 FOR CHERRYWOOD
DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS IN THE TOWNSHIP OF GLOUCESTER 

WHEREAS, it was necessary to make changes in the scope of work to be done in 
completing the Cherrywood Drainage improvements in the Township of Gloucester, 

WHEREAS, Change Order No. 1 was developed to itemize and authorize those changes; 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township 

of Gloucester that Change Order No. 1 is hereby authorized and approval is hereby granted to 
revise the contract cost from $1,357,717.20 to $1,327,247.69. 
Adopted: October 22, 2012

___________________________________
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL 

ATTEST:

_____________________________________
TOWNSHIP CLERK 
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

R-12:10-232
RESOLUTION AWARDING BID FOR SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL SERVICES AND

AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF CONTRACT
FOR THE TOWNSHIP OF GLOUCESTER

WHEREAS, the County of Camden, as the Lead Agency for the Camden County 
Cooperative Pricing System, System Identifier # 57-CCCPS (Cooperative), received and opened 
bids at its Division of Purchasing on August 2, 2012 at 11:00 A.M., Prevailing Time, for Bid A-
25 for Disposal of Solid Waste for Camden County, various Camden County Agencies and 
various Camden County Municipalities under the  Camden County Cooperative Pricing System, 
System Identifier # 57-CCCPS, the receipt of which bids were duly advertised in accordance 
with law; and

WHEREAS, four bids were received;
Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LLC
BFI Transfer Systems of Pa.
Covanta 4Recovery
Republic Services of NJ, LLC; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Chosen Freeholders awarded a contract to the lowest 
responsible bidder, Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP, 600 Morgan Boulevard, 
Camden, NJ 08104 for (Option 1) as listed on the schedule attached hereto for the services 
required for the needs of the County of Camden and other Cooperative Purchasing Members; and

WHEREAS the term of agreement shall commence on or about January 1, 2013 through 
December 31, 2014 (Year 2 and Year 3 as indicated in the bid specifications)with the pricing as 
indicated on the schedule below, with a single one-year option to renew at the sole discretion of 
the County; and

WHEREAS, Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP has extended pricing to 
both Camden County and to the members of the Camden County Cooperative Pricing System as 
set forth in the bid specifications; and



WHEREAS, the Township of Gloucester is a participant in the Camden County 
Cooperative Pricing System and this bid; and

WHEREAS, it has been determined that bid option #1 for Disposal Services of 
approximately 25,000 Tons Annually" provides for the best benefit to the Township of 
Gloucester; and

WHEREAS, the bids have been evaluated by the Township Engineer and Purchasing 
Agent, and the recommendation is made as herein after provided to the lowest responsible bidder 
to comply with the uniform bid specifications, Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP; 
and

WHEREAS, bid option #1 provides for  the cost of  $61.00 per ton for the period of 
January 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013; and the cost of $63.00 per ton for the period of 
January 1, 2014 through  December 31, 2014; and 

WHEREAS, the Township of Gloucester will participate in any subsequent extension 
years as provided in the bid specifications; and

WHEREAS, upon adoption, a copy of this approving Resolution shall be transmitted to 
Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP in order to effectuate formal notice of 
Township of Gloucester intention to exercise its option for the initial term of this bid; and

WHEREAS, the Township of Gloucester CFO will certify that sufficient, available and 
legally appropriated funds for this expenditure are available.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township of Gloucester, in the 
County of Camden as follows:
1. The provisions of the WHEREAS clauses set forth above are incorporated herein by reference 
and made a part hereof.
2. The Bid and Contract for Solid Waste Disposal is hereby awarded, subject to the necessary 
funds being appropriated by the governing body for all fiscal years to Camden County Energy 
Recovery Associates, LP, for a term of twenty-four months, commencing on or about  January 1, 
2013 and terminating on December 31, 2014, for the disposal prices as indicated herein.
3. The Township of Gloucester in the County of  Camden, does hereby authorize the proper 
officials to execute and award a contract to Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP for 
the term stated herein, in a form to be approved by the Solicitor of the Township of Gloucester.
4. This contract is awarded subject to the State Treasurer approving the Affirmative Action of the 
successful bidder.
5. A copy of this Resolution shall be forwarded to Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, 
LP at: 600 Morgan Boulevard, Camden, New Jersey 08104, and Perryville Corporate Park, 
Clinton, New Jersey 08809-4000.
OPTION 1 – ENTIRE CAMDEN COUNTY COOPERATIVE PRICING GROUP
VENDOR          YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3      YEAR 4     
(PER  TON  PRICING)     
Camden County Energy
 Recovery Associates, LLC $59.00 $61.00 $63.00        $76.00
*BFI Transfer Systems of Pa. $63.00 $63.00 $64.74        $66.53
*Covanta 4Recovery $63.00 $64.16 $65.34        $66.55
Republic Services of NJ, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid         No Bid

*Out of state facility: additional cost per ton is reflected in per ton pricing.
**Year 1 term: September 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012 
Options:
Year 4 term year to be exercised in the sole discretion of the County of Camden

Adopted: October 22, 2 012

ATTEST: _________________________
President of Council

___________________________________
Township Clerk
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.



R-12:10-233
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING REFUNDS FROM THE DEPARTMENT 

OF COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of Gloucester that the
following refunds be and are hereby authorized:

#3304-061111INSP
577 Cross Keys Road
Block 18404 Lot 4
Megha Real Estate Holding, Co.
1950 Street Road
Suite 204
Bensalem, PA  19020
Balance from unexpended escrow:  $37.16

#3315-081029INSP
2875 Erial New Brooklyn Road
Block 15302 Lot 32 & 34
Metro PCS of Pennsylvania
510 Virginia Drive
Fort Washington, PA  19034
Balance from unexpended escrow:  $106.00

Adopted:   October 22, 2012
____________________________________
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL

ATTEST:

________________________________________
TOWNSHIP CLERK
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

R-12:10-234
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Township Council of the Township of Gloucester, 
in the County of Camden, that the following bills are approved by the Township Council in 
accordance with the provisions of Ordinance 0-82-16 and certified by the Chief Financial Officer 
that the claims are proper obligation of the township, that adequate funds are available to honor 
these claims in the account indicated and the claim should be paid:

CURRENT ACCOUNT
Per attached computer readout of the claims presented in the amount of $ 6,356,455.73

CAPITAL ACCOUNT
Per attached computer read out of the claims presented in the amount of $ 838,007.15

DEVELOPERS ESCROW FUND
Per attached computer readout of the claims presented in the amount of $ 4,136.00

TRUST OTHER
Per attached computer readout of the claims presented in the amount of $ 159,298.22

ANIMAL TRUST FUND
Per attached computer readout of the claims presented in the amount of    $ 9,329.10

TRUST OTHER
12-03675 US Bank Cust/Empire Tax Funding

Manual Check 12160            11,816.62

12-04327 Crusader Lien Services
Manual Check 12170             94,586.00



12-04328 US Bank Cust/Lienlogic Fund
Manual Check 12172   6,448.48

12-04326 Plymouth Park Tax Service
Manual Check 12171             19,861.74

12-04329 US Bank/ Cust for Towerdbw LLC
Manual Check 12173             13,296.78

12-03791 Joseph Hassab
Manual Check 12162              55,475.79

12-04351 Comcast
Manual Check 20429    1,009.90

TRUST AGENCY
Manual Check 12079 – 12088  74,024.63
Manual Check 12089 - 12100            315,870.25

CURRENT
12-04228 M.C.A.N.J

Manual Check 82315         55.00

12-04226 Chris Jones
Manual Check 82317       298.15

12-04387 AmeriHealth Admin. Inc.
Manual Check 82322      725.00

12-04385 Salem County Clerk
Manual Check 82321        50.00

12-04390 Horizon
Manual Check 82326            35,936.60

12-04362 NJLM 95th Annual League
Manual Check 82327                 550.00

12-04451 GT. MUA
Manual Check 82329       43.00

12-04463 Aqua New Jersey
Manual Check 82330     112.98

12-04505 Camden County Clerk
Manual Check 82331       83.00

                __________________________               
        PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL

Adopted:  October 22, 2012

ATTEST:

______________________________
TOWNSHIP CLERK
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

R-12:10-235
RESOLUTION CORRECTING ERRONEOUS ASSESSMENTS FOR THE SECOND 

HALF YEAR 2012 AS INDICATED, AND TO AUTHORIZE THE TAX COLLECTOR TO 
REFUND ANY OVERPAYMENTS.



     
WHEREAS, the following properties in the Township of Gloucester, as indicated 

by block and lot number, have received an erroneous assessment for the indicated reason, and,
WHEREAS, the Township Assessor has reviewed and made corrections of said 

errors,
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of 

Gloucester, that the following properties be reduced for the years and reasons stated and the Tax 
Collector is hereby authorized to credit each tax account and refund any over-payments:

 
BLOCK LOT NAME & REASON REDUCTION OF ASSESS RED. TAXES
ACCOUNT
             
17605 6         Constance Reich   Credit for 2012 3rd and 4th Qtr $110.53
                       Error in calculation on prop rec
                                                                                    $6,800 assessment 

17908 10        John Laflar   Credit for 2012 3rd and 4th Qtr $147.92
                       Error in calculation on prop rec
                                                                                  $9,100 assessment

Adopted: October 22, 2012

_______________________________________
President of Council

__________________________________
Township Clerk 
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

R-12:10-236
 RESOLUTION TO ALLOW DISABLED VETERAN EXEMPTIONS FOR TAX YEAR 

2012 AND TO AUTHORIZE THE TAX COLLECTOR TO CANCEL TAXES AND 
REFUND ANY OVERPAYMENTS

     
WHEREAS,  the  following names are owners  and residents  of  property in  the 

Township of Gloucester, and
WHEREAS, they have made proper application for Total and Permanent Service-

Connected Disability tax exempt status on their property designated with the block and lots listed 
below and,

WHEREAS, they  have  submitted  proper  evidence  of  Total  and  Permanent 
Disability rating from the U.S. Veterans Administration in accordance with State Regulations.

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of 
Gloucester that the Tax Collector is authorized to grant said exemption, cancel property taxes for 
2012 and preliminary 2013 billing and refund any resulting credit balances.
Block Lot Name Comment           Amount to be Credited

17504      12        John Andrews           Add Disabled Veteran    $2497.16 
                         Tax Exemption               

                                                                      5 mos. 2012 (assmt $195,100)
                         Also First Half 2013     C              $2,996.60

19002      1          Bruce Seddon           Add Disabled Veteran          $3,090.00 
                        Tax Exemption               

                                                                     4 mos. 2012 (assmt $297,500)
                        Also First Half 2013    C                $4,635.00

ADOPTED: October 22, 2012  
_________________________________
President of Council

__________________________________
Township Clerk
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.



R-12:10-237
RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE TAX COLLECTOR TO GRANT SENIOR 
CITIZEN, DISABLED, OR VETERAN DEDUCTION FOR THE YEAR 2012 AS 

INDICATED AND TO ADJUST ANY BALANCE

WHEREAS, the following applicants are the owners of a residential property located in 
the Township of Gloucester, and,

WHEREAS, they have properly filed an application for a Senior Citizen, Disabled, or 
Veteran Deduction with proof of eligibility, and

WHEREAS, the Assessor has reviewed and approved said application,
  THEREFORE,  BE  IT RESOLVED  by  the  Township  Council  of  the  Township  of 
Gloucester that the Tax Collector is authorized to grant said deduction and/or adjust any resulting 
balances for the year 2012 and refund any balances for the amounts indicated.
  Block Lot Name Comment Amount of Deduction

4708    29 Kenneth Keough     Add Veteran              250.00
                      Deduction 2012

7701  5     Janet Gazer        Add Sen Cit             250.00
             Deduction 2012

8002  2C2805 Karen Bevilacqua   Add Disability            250.00
              Deduction 2012

10105 7 Gerard Nachbar Add Veteran 500.00
Deduction 2011/2012

11206 18    Gloria Imparato  Add Wid & Sen Cit       500.00
              Deduction 2012

12102 21    Joseph Youkneveich Jr Add Veteran        250.00
              Deduction 2012

13002 14     Abraham Smalls    Add Veteran              250.00
              Deduction 2012

13502 55    James Fitzgerald   Add Veteran             250.00
             Deduction 2012

13602 7  Pasquale Locantore Add Veteran              250.00
              Deduction 2012

16203   1 Walter Bowman      Add Veteran              250.00
             Deduction 2012     

ADOPTED: October 22, 2012

________________________________
President of Council

___________________________________
Township Clerk 
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

R-12:10-238
RESOLUTION CORRECTING ERRONEOUS ASSESSMENTS FOR THE YEAR 2012 
AS INDICATED, AND TO AUTHORIZE THE TAX COLLECTOR TO REFUND ANY 

OVERPAYMENTS.
     

WHEREAS, the following properties in the Township of Gloucester, as indicated 
by block and lot number, have received an erroneous assessment for the indicated reason,

WHEREAS, the Township Assessor has reviewed and made corrections of said 
errors,



THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of 
Gloucester, that the following properties be reduced for the years and reasons stated and the Tax 
Collector is hereby authorized to credit each tax account and refund any over-payments:

 
BLOCK LOT NAME & REASON REDUCTION OF ASSESS RED. TAXES
ACCOUNT
             
2001 28     Mary Mele Kennedy Reduce for error in calculation $802.64

                 12 mos $25,400 assessment

ADOPTED: October 22, 2012
_______________________________________
President of Council

__________________________________
Township Clerk 
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

REGULAR AGENDA

R-12:10-239
RESOLUTION CONSIDERING APPLICATION OF FRANK LAULETTA, JR FOR 
A PERSON TO PERSON TRANSFER  OF  A  PLENARY  RETAIL  CONSUMPTION 
LICENSE HELD BY CHARLIE BROWN’S OF BLACKWOOD, LLC (in pocket)

WHEREAS,  Frank Lauletta Jr. has made application for transfer of  A Plenary Retail 
Consumption License held by Charlie Brown’s of Blackwood, LLC (in pocket), and

WHEREAS, notice of said transfer has been duly published, and 
WHEREAS, no objections have been filed, and 
WHEREAS, the applicant has disclosed and the authority has reviewed the source of all 

funds used in the purchase of the license and the licensed business, and all additional financing 
obtained in connection with the licensed business, and 

WHEREAS, the Authority has received a written and sworn affidavit by an authorized 
representative of both the transferor and transferee, affirming that the transferee is aware of all 
obligations  outstanding  to  New  Jersey  Alcoholic  Beverage  manufacturers,  wholesalers,  and 
distributors, and that either the transferee has assumed any such obligations or the obligations 
have been or will be satisfied by the transferor out of the proceeds of the sale of the licensed 
business. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township 
of Gloucester, County of Camden, that the application of  Frank Lauletta, Jr. for  a person to  
person  transfer of  a Plenary Retail Consumption License be and is hereby approved . 
Adopted: October 22, 2012

___________________________________
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL 

ATTEST:

_____________________________________
TOWNSHIP CLERK
Mr. Mercado made a motion to adopt, seconded by Mr. Hutchison.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried.  6-0.

MAYOR’S REPORT
Mayor Mayer welcomed Boy Scout Troop 811 to the meeting.  He stated that the scouts are 
visiting as they are working on merit badges while attending the meeting.  Mayor Mayer stated 
that this weekend is Make A Difference Day and everyone will be working in the community 
park.  He also stated that there will be a Halloween Party in the Recreation Center and a Ghost 
seminar at the Gabriel Davies Tavern.  Mayor Mayer also thanked Mainstage and everyone who 
worked on the Pumpkin Festival.
Mayor Mayer stated that he also wanted to address the Disc Golf proposal at the Timber Creek 
Park.  He stated that there is a proposal for Disc Golf at the Timber Creek Park. He stated that the 
plan he viewed was using the lower end of the dog park.  He stated that his concern was that it 
was encroaching on some of the sensitive areas of the park.  He stated that a balance must be 
struck, giving recreation to the township while also protecting the natural resources of the park. 



He stated that there are some areas of the Timber Creek Park that are conducive to this type of 
recreation.  He stated that this is a county park and it would be a decision that they have to make.
A resident asked the Mayor how he communicated this with the County.  Mayor Mayer stated 
that it was a verbal communication.  The resident asked the Mayor if this could be put in written 
form so that the resident could inform the people who care about the park and the wildlife and 
the nature in the park.
Mayor Mayer stated that he feels that both things could be accomplished at the park, but it must 
be done the right way.  The resident also thanked Mr. Mercado for speaking with him.

PUBLIC PORTION
Mr. Bianchini opened the public portion.
Joanne Carr of Timberbirch reminded everyone about the Family Ghost Night at the Gabriel 
Daveis Tavern, weather permitting.  She thanked Mr. Moffa and the Public Works Department 
for fixing the Interlante property and giving them a place to have their meetings.
There being no further comment, the public portion was closed.

POLLING OF COUNCIL
Mr. Hutchison thanked Boy Scout Troop 811 for coming to the meeting.  He also thanked the 
residents for coming to the meeting.
Mr. Schmidt thanked the residents for coming to the meeting. He thanked the Boy Scout Troop 
for coming to the meeting and stated that it was good seeing them.
Mr. Siler stated that he was pleased to see everyone at the Pumpkin Festival.
Mrs. Trotto thanked everyone for coming to the meeting.
Mr. Mercado thanked everyone for coming to the meeting.  He thanked the Police Department 
and Public Works Department for all the work they did at the Pumpkin Festival.
Mr.  Bianchini  thanked  the  residents  for  attending  the  meeting.   He  thanked  the  Police 
Department and the Public Works Department for all their hard work with the Pumpkin Festival. 
Mr. Bianchini stated that he was in Timber Creek Park and he stated that he was glad to see that 
it had been preserved and he is glad Gloucester Township has a voice in the forefront. 

Mr. Siler made a motion to adjourn, seconded by Mr. Mercado.  Roll call vote:  All in favor. 
Motion carried. 6-0.

Respectfully submitted,

______________________________ Rosemary DiJosie
President of Council Township Clerk


